
Book-Inspired 

1. Matilda (Roald Dahl) – Blue dress (or any simple dress), red ribbon in hair, book 
in hand. 

2. Katniss Everdeen (The Hunger Games) – Black/khaki pants, dark jacket, braid, 
makeshift bow (stick). 

3. Sherlock Holmes – Dark coat/jacket, scarf, carry a notebook or magnifying glass 
(real or improvised). 

4. Pippi Longstocking – Bright mismatched clothes, two pigtails (bend with 
wire/pipe cleaner if possible), striped socks. 

5. The Man in the Yellow Hat (Curious George) – Yellow shirt, pants, and a simple 
hat (any light-coloured one works). 

6. Where’s Wally/Waldo – Striped shirt, jeans, glasses (or draw circles on paper 
and stick to sunglasses). 

7. Jay Gatsby (The Great Gatsby) – Dress in your sharpest clothes: collared shirt, 
blazer, slicked hair. 

8. Anne Shirley (Anne of Green Gables) – Long dress or skirt, braided hair, straw 
hat if possible. 

 

Movie Characters 

9. Marty McFly (Back to the Future) – Jeans, checkered shirt, denim jacket or 
puƯer vest. 

10. Indiana Jones – Brown jacket, khaki pants, button-up shirt, satchel, toy whip or 
coiled rope. 

11. Lara Croft (Tomb Raider) – Tank top, shorts/khaki pants, boots, backpack. 

12. Men in Black Agent – Black suit (or black pants + jacket), white shirt, 
sunglasses. 

13. The Blues Brothers – Black pants, white shirt, black tie, jacket, sunglasses. 

14. Rosie the Riveter – Blue shirt, rolled-up sleeves, jeans, red bandana tied in hair. 

15. The Matrix (Neo/Trinity) – Black pants, black top, black jacket/coat, sunglasses. 

16. Ferris Bueller – White t-shirt, patterned vest/jacket, jeans. 

 



TV Show Characters 

17. Dwight Schrute (The OƯice) – Mustard yellow shirt, tie, glasses, parted hair. 

18. Wednesday Addams (The Addams Family) – Black dress (or black top/skirt), 
white collar, braided pigtails. 

19. Rachel Green (Friends) – 90s-style jeans/skirt, fitted top, layered hairstyle. 

20. Ted Lasso – Polo or sweater, khakis, sneakers, and a fake moustache. 

21. Eleven (Stranger Things) – Pink dress (or plain dress), oversized jacket, white 
socks; carry Eggo waƯles (optional). 

22. The Doctor (Doctor Who) – Mix-and-match quirky outfit: blazer, bowtie/scarf, 
Converse shoes. 

23. Sheldon Cooper (The Big Bang Theory) – Graphic t-shirt (superhero/Star Trek) 
over long-sleeve shirt. 

24. Moira Rose (Schitt’s Creek) – All black or dramatic outfit, bold accessories, 
eccentric hairstyle. 

 

General/Fun Pop Culture 

25. Tourist – Bright shirt, shorts, sneakers, sunglasses, camera around neck. 

26. Detective/Film Noir Look – Dark jacket, collared shirt, trench coat if possible, 
notebook & pen. 

27. Sports Coach – Tracksuit, whistle, cap, sneakers. 

28. Hipster/Beat Poet – Striped top or black turtleneck, jeans, beanie or beret, 
notebook. 

29. 80s Teen Movie Character – Jeans, oversized sweater or denim jacket, sneakers, 
big hair. 

30. Zombie (Generic) – Rip or rough up regular clothes a little, messy hair, pale face 
makeup. 

 


